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35143. (a)  The governing board of each school district shall hold an annual 
organizational meeting. In a year in which a regular election for governing board 
members is conducted, the meeting shall be held on a day within a 15-day period that 
commences with the second Friday in December following the regular election. 
Organizational meetings in years in which no such regular election for governing 
board members is conducted shall be held on any date in December, but no later than 
December 20. Unless otherwise provided by rule of the governing board, the day and 
time of the annual meeting shall be selected, in a year in which a regular election for 
governing board members is conducted, by the board at its regular meeting held 
immediately before the first day of such 15-day period, or in a year in which no such 
regular election for governing board members is conducted, by the board at its last 
regular meeting held immediately before the organizational meeting. The board shall 
notify the county superintendent of schools of the day and time selected. The clerk 
of the board shall, within 15 days before the date of the annual meeting, notify in 
writing all members and members-elect of the date and time selected for the meeting. 

(b)  If the board fails to select a day and time for the meeting, the county 
superintendent of schools having jurisdiction over the district shall, before the first 
day of such 15-day period and after the regular meeting of the board held immediately 
before the first day of such 15-day period, designate the day and time of the annual 
meeting. The day designated shall be within the 15-day period. The county 
superintendent of schools shall notify in writing all members and members-elect of 
the date and time. 

(c)  At the annual meeting the governing board of each high school district, union 
high school district, and joint union high school district shall organize by electing a 
president from its members and a clerk. 

(d)  At the annual meeting each city board of education shall organize by electing 
a president from its members. 

(e)  At the annual meeting the governing board of each other type of school district, 
except a community college district, shall elect one of its members clerk of the district. 

(f)  As an alternative to the procedures set forth in this section, a city board of 
education whose members are elected in accordance with a city charter for terms of 
office commencing in December, may hold its annual organizational meeting required 
in this section between December 15 and January 14, inclusive, as provided in rules 
and regulations that shall be adopted by such board. At the annual meeting the city 
board of education shall organize by electing a president and vice president from its 
members who shall serve in such office during the period January 15 next to the 



following January 14, unless removed from such office by majority vote of all members 
of the city board of education. 

(Amended by Stats. 2021, Ch. 666, Sec. 24.  (AB 486)  Effective January 1, 2022.) 
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